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Abstract
We describe a clinical case of  ARDS in an HIV infect-
ed patient. ARDS was associated to a respiratory syn-
cytial virus infection that triggered a suspected Pneu-
mocystis infection that despite missing etiologic
proofs was treated with antimycotics. As rather limited
information on RSV associated ARDS in HIV patients
is available in the current literature, this case is of  sig-
nificant interest.
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INTRODUCTION

The respiratory syncytial virus (RSV) is a well known
pathogen belonging to the family of  paramyxoviruses
that causes respiratory disease mainly in children (En-
glund et al., 1997; Whimbey & Ghosh, 2000). In pa-
tients with distinct co-morbidities RSV is also known
to induce severe clinical courses of  atypical pneumo-
nia that in immune-compromised patients may lead to
an acute respiratory distress syndrome (ARDS), some-
times with a fatal outcome. Surprisingly, although the
virus is known since decades, less is known on the role
of  RSV neither in the pathogenesis of  pneumonia in
adults, nor in immune-suppressed or HIV patients
(King 1997; Whimbey 1995; Couch et al., 1997). As
for both otherwise healthy adults and also for im-
munocompromised as well as HIV infected patients a
number of  reports of  severe pneumonia associated to
new or (re)emerging pathogens have been described
(Englund et al., 2006; Kupfer et al., 2006) we have re-
cently initiated a prospective study on the prevalence
of  such viruses in our patient cohorts (Müller et al.,
2007; Kupfer et al., 2007). In search for such new
pathogens we identified RSV as the single pathogen
associated to severe pneumonia in an adult HIV pa-
tient. 

CASE REPORT

The previously healthy 42-yr-old caucasian male was
admitted to our hospital with a 7-week history of
worsening dyspnoea, productive cough, fatigue and
significant weight loss. Since 10 days the patient suf-
fered from high fevers up to 40OC. Furthermore the
patient had a panaritium of  the right index finger,

which had been treated by surgical incision twice with-
in the past 4 weeks. The patient was on oral antibiotic
therapy with cefixim and roxithromycin for 10 days.
On admission the patient presented highly dyspneic.
With 15 liters of  oxygen via a non-sealing face mask
the respiratory rate was 33/min, PaO2 93 mm Hg,
PaCO2 35 mm Hg and the pH 7.4, PaO2/FiO2 < 200;
thereby, the latter quotient underlines the clinical
severity of  the ARDS in this patient. Chest X-ray
showed bilateral patchy alveolar lower zone shadowing
left more than right consistent with ARDS. On admis-
sion, total white cell count was 9.9 x 109/l, procalci-
tonin 0.44 µg/l, CD3/4+ lymphocytes 2% (8/µl),
CD4/CD8 lymphocyte ratio 0.04. Serum HIV testing
by enzyme-linked immunoassay and HIV-1 by western
blot were positive as well as a positive HIV-p24 anti-
gen testing. Quantitative HIV RNA (bDNA) revealed
130.000 copies/ml. Due to the clinical and radiological
signs of  atypical pneumonia and the risk of  pneumo-
cystis jiroveci pneumonia a calculated empiric antimi-
crobial therapy consisting of  meropenem, erythro -
mycin, moxifloxacin, sulfamethoxazole, trimethoprim,
fluconazole and pentamidine (via inhalation) was initi-
ated. A bronchoalveolar lavage was performed and
blood cultures were drawn. To maintain adequate oxy-
genation highflow CPAP (continuous positive airway
pressure) ventilation via a sealed face-mask was initiat-
ed.

Based on microbiological results (see below) antimi-
crobial therapy was deescalated after 3 days. However,
intravenous sulfamethoxazole and trimethoprim was
continued due the clinical appearance and likelihood
of  Pneumocystis jirovici pneumonia. 

The patient tolerated the sealed face-mask very
well, and due to excellent patient compliance CPAP
was continuously administered for 5 days, thus avoid-
ing intubation. Oxygenation improved slowly so that
FiO2 and PEEP could be reduced gradually. On day
+5 management was changed to intermittent CPAP
with oxygen supplementation at intervals via a non
sealing face-mask. Further improvement of  the respi-
ratory situation allowed weaning from intermittent
CPAP and the patient could be transferred from the
intensive care unit (ICU) to peripheral ward on day
+12. 

After admission to the peripheral ward the patient
clinically further stabilized. Intravenous sulfamethoxa-
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zole and trimethoprim was continued for up to three
weeks while all other antibiotics were discontinued. An
antiretroviral therapy was initiated including
lopinavir/ritonavir plus emtricitabine and tenofovir.
Consecutively a viral load decrease to 512 copies/ml
within four weeks could be observed while CD3/4+
lymphocytes increased to 6% (118/µl). On day +21
the patient was discharged and is currently followed at
the HIV outpatient department. He is on his antiretro-
viral therapy and on secondary prophylaxis with oral
sulfamethoxazole and trimethoprim reporting general
well being.

All microbiological results of  bronchoalveolar
lavage fluid (including direct immunofluorescence)
and from blood cultures revealed negative results. Nei-
ther any bacteria causing respiratory diseases nor
Pneumocystis jiroveci were detected in any of  the
specimen. In analogy to and with the identical
methodology of  previous cases PCR for human bo-
cavirus (hBoV) and RT-PCR specific for human
metapneumovirus (HMPV), human coronaviruses in-
cluding the subtypes NL63, OC43, 229E, SARS, and
HKU1, as well as RT-PCR for RSV and influenza
viruses A and B were performed from the clinical
samples, all revealing negative results except the RT-
PCR for RSV. 

DISCUSSION

Based on both the clinical observations and the labo-
ratory results it is rather likely that the pneumonia was
associated to RSV rather than to any other pathogen.
Still, due the clinical improvement within a few days
after initiation of  Pneumocystis jirovici-specific antibi-
otic treatment we cannot rule out Pneumocystis jirovi-
ci as the causing pathogen. However, besides the lack
of  a finding of  any other pathogen the period the pa-
tient suffered from pneumonia also strongly resem-
bled the clinical course of  a typical RSV related atypi-
cal pneumonia. Consequently, in concert with earlier
findings, not only Pneumocyctis jiroveci and Mycobac-
terium tuberculosis but also the new and (re)emerging
viruses have to be tested in case of  severe pneumonia
of  HIV patients. 
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